
To: Ann Rodriquez' 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 10/30/2013 7:09:12 PM 
Subject: Re: Chris Sheehan invoice 

yes 

On Wed, Oct 30, 2013 at 3:08 PM, Ann Rodriquez cca wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Just confirming, Should we continue to pay Chris his normal invoice amount on days that you 
are requesting quiet time. 

Quiet time: Days that you are on Island and would not like employees to work. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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