From: J
Sent: Tue
Subject: Re:
Yes

Sent from my

on 0ct 29, 2013, at 1023 AM, Richard K O~

Please

Sent from my

10/29/2013 2:25:14 PM
Zorro Ranch

iPad

advise on fast track fee of 1,950.

iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

Date: Octobe

Ce: bellaklein

From: "Putney, Jackie" -
r29 2013 at 10:17:36 AM EDT

Subject: RE:

Zorro Ranch

Hi Rich, we got the estimated delivery date of Jan 5. The factory did tell
me that for a fast track fee of 51,950.00 they can have it delivered the
week of Dec 9, but they need to know today. Please let me know if you

would like to proceed with the Jan 5" date or pay the quick ship fee for Dec

9", Thank you, have a great day!!

Jackie Putney

Direct Sales Account Manager
Trane Commercial Systems
Ingersoll Rand

Albuguerque, NM 87113
USA

Website: www.trane.com
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Sent: Monday, October 28, 2013 1:57 PM
To: Putney, Jackie

Cc: bellaklein

Subject: Re: Zorro Ranch

Importance: High

replacing
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

On Oct 28, 2013 at 3:53 PM. "Putney, Jackie"
: wrote:

Hi—1 just need to know if you will be cleaning the coil or replacing it.
Thanks,

Jackie Putney

Direct Sales Account Manager

Trane Commercial Systems

Albuquerque, NM B7113
USA

Website: www.trane.com
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Sent: Monday, October 28, 20131

To: Putney, Jackie
Cc: Rich Kahn
Subject: Zorro Ranch

Jackie,
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As per our conversation attached please find the signed agreement for
Zorro Ranch PoolPak quote. As discussed, please ask accounting
department to contact Bella Klen for 50% deposit payment by credit
card.

Thank you,
Bella
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