
To: Je vacation 'eevacation@gmail.corni 
From: 
Sent Thur 10/17/2013 1:53:16 AM 
Subject: Re: update 

Jeffrey, 
GII purchase agreement was signed by buyer this afternoon, Darren wants to speak with you 
before approving. 

B727, I just received final invoice for work completed on Boeing, Morrison and I are reviewing 
invoice. We are waiting for Fwd Airstair motor to be overhauled, no pans arc available, we will 
complete Test flight next week, if we cannot remedy Air Stair parts issue, we can Rig airstairs 
inoperative so we can accomplish first test flight. 

GIV, Eric is finishing installation of recessed 1phone5 charging dock in ledge fwd of cup holder. 

GIV Should be completed by noon tomorrow, I'll wait to hear from you if decide to arrive at islip 
for our departure.. 

Thx 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Wed, 16 Oct 2013 21:43:54 -0400 
To 
Subject: 

where are we with g2, 727 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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