
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Tue 9/3/2013 1:46:27 PM 
Subject Re: 

refund 

On Tue, Sep 3, 2013 at 9:44 AM, Richard Kahn .a wrote: 

roy and stephanie came from recruiting company called crew unlimited not peter mahler 
we paid a 7% fee (19,000 x 12 = 228,000 x 7% = 15,960) 
we neogtiated a 240 day replacment period 
should i pursue other candidates or request a refund 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor. 
New York, New York 10022 
tel  
fax 646-350-0954 

cel 

On Sep 2, 2013, at 3:10 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

tell peter mahoer to return the fee for roy and stcph, they haven[t done anything 
in months. today i went around to find cobwebs in many places. brokein hidnges 
phones. its nuts. 
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