
To: jeevacationeDgmail.com[jeevacationellgmail.com] 
From: Eileen Alexanderson 
Sent Thur 9/26/2013 11:24:30 AM 
Subject: Re: 

Interestingly, my understanding is they both have a base of 250k and bonus of 100k but need to check. 
doesn't totally make sense since he is a partner at RI< and she isn't. May be late enough in the year that 
they are looking to get bought out of bonus but maybe not. Will assemble thoughts on pkg later this 
morn. I have been inclined to staff with salary only but would like your thoughts - Leon's attitude is why 
would I give a bonus for doing the job I hired the person to do but if we go with Rich bonus might be 
appropriate. We woke up to a burst hot water heater here at my house. So I won't be in until 9-will be 
back once I have definite intelligence re comp. Leon seemed inclined toward Rich where do you come 
out? 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacabon@gmailicom] 
Sent: Thursday, September 26, 2013 06:51 AM Eastern Standard Time 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: 

how much for lisa.. rich ? package? 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to ieovacationgsmailicom, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential 
and intended solely for the person or entity to whom they are 
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged 
material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or 
other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this 
information by persons or entities other than the intended 
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in 
error please contact the sender and delete the material from 
any computer. 
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