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I will pay 

Jeffrey Epstein 
Sun 9/22/2013 7:16:28 PM 
Re: 

On Sunday, September 22, 2013, Michelle wrote: 

I need to to do lot of homework to collect lot of documents (references, letters, pictures etc), 
I already sent her my portfolio and all the pictures from any fashion show I did. Than pay this 
visa fee and I hope Pm gonna get it. But she said she was sure I would get it. I just need to get 
lot of letters from american ppl in fashion to 'prove' government that I will have lot of 
opportunities to work in US as model. 

On 22.9.2013, at 15:30, Jeffrey Epstein <ieevacationOvin;iil coin> wrote: 

how did it go with the lawyer? 

***** ****************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacationOgmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

************************************** ********************* 

The information contained in this communication is 

confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 

EFTA_R1_00431464 

EFTA01958865



communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_00431465 

EFTA01958866


