To: JEE[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Cecile de Jongh
Sent; Mon 8/5/2013 5:44:44 PM

Subject: Re: First Resort vs LSJ, LLC.

Jeffrey,

This is going to go before the EDA. Wally or his wife Shaun (owner of The Source) will write a
complaint to the Commuission about you not paying. We can't keep 1ignoring this in the hopes that
he will go away. He is not going to go away.

Additionally, this will end up on John's desk and he would just as soon avoid that. There is no
dispute that First Resort did the work and did it well. We do not need this. Let's pay it and be

done. We will never have to use him again.

With warm regards,
Cecile

Sent from my 1Phone

On Aug 5, 2013, at 1:25 PM, Cecile de Jongh _ wrote:

Jeffrey,

Please see the attached default judgment in favor of First Resort Painting. LSJ owes this re the
paint job that was done some two years ago and the vendor was never paid. [ really, really think

you should pay this ASAP.

With warm regards,
Cecile

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: ann rodriquez
Date: August 2, 20134
To: Cecile deJongh
Subject: First Resort vs
Reply-To: ann rodriquez

as you requested...

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly
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prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete all copies.
<First Resort vs. LSJ, LLC. pdf>
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