
To: Ivje 
From: Jeffrey  qp s 
Sent Thur 8/15/2013 6:56:06 PM 
Subject Re: GIV date 

i want stark carpet , eventualoy eric should find copy or order. 

On Thu, Aug 15, 2013 at 11:55 AM wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Eric estimates Sept 5th completion date for GIV. 
He trying to locate a tan carpet for seat base and side panel Air duct. Eric said he wants to speak 

with Rich regarding carpet credit since temperary carpet is less expensive cost per sq yrd, 
Thx 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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