
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfleevacation@gmail.comj 
From: Roy Hodges 
Sent Wed 8/14/2013 1:00:00 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Fraguela 

Just after we spoke yesterday, Daphne sent this email. Our big hold up is the 
permitting for the road. We need to wrap things up with Jaredian to get the permits 
pushed through. The tile job will start on Monday. Jimmy said to allow 14 days for 
completion of this portion of the job. 

 Forwarded me 
From: Daphne Wallac 
Date: Tue, Aug 13, 201 at : 
Subject: Re: Fragucla 
To: Roy Hodge Rich Kahn 

Greetings Roy, 
Was actually on the phone with Jimmy. 

I. Yes, still on schedule to begin next Monday, August 19. 

2. Mason for Main entrance - 8 man team - 5 stone masons ® $30/hr, 3 helpers @ $16/hr. They 
would work 8 hours days, Jimmy to discuss with masons how many days the project will take. 

Concern and reality - concrete mixer trucks and any heavy-laden trucks going over the main 
entrance completed in natural stone - Jimmy believes it will eventually crack. 

Need to come up with alternatives to the natural stone - maybe a concrete base, etc. . . 

3. The deck drains arc sailing tomorrow night - the last component for the pool tiling is the grout -
Jimmy is calling the tile guy to get the quantity needed so I can reserve at Floor Factory. Rich, I 
will let you know cost as soon as I know. 

4. The road permit - spoke with Moseley this morning - be is contacting Jaredian (John Woods) 
directly to confirm what he needs and then will schedule coming to LSJ. 

In the meanwhile, JE and DKI should have received from Cecile the Jaredian proposal for review, 
agreement and signature - Jaredian will submit and expedite the road permit for the gym road. 
They already have the survey. 

5. Thing to iron out for next week - boat schedule - Little C has a 16 person cap says Carlos -
not sure how many Jimmy has. 

DW 
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On Tue, Aug 13, 2013 at 4:31 PM, Roy Hodge wrote: 

JE just called and asked what Jimmy's timeframe is. Have you heard anything from him 
recently? 

Roy & Stephanie Hodges 

Roy & Stephanie Hodges 
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