
To: Jeffrey EpsteinueevacationagmaiLcomj 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Wed 8/14/2013 2:22:55 PM 
Subject Fwd: Figures for Links 

fyi - i was supposed to have conference call with Brice and Richard Boltz yesterday 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fa 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: BMG 
Date: August 13, 2013 9:06:03 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: Figures for Links 

Sony 
Had major Internet issues today 
Will try and set setting up tomorrow afternoon 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 13, 2013, at 12:42 PM, Richard Kahn ote: 

i thought we were talking today at 12pm est? 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Boltz 
Date: August 8. 2013 10:29:26 AM EDT 
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To: BMG 
Cc: "Richard Kahn 

Pat Mosca 

Subject: RE: Figures for Links 

Brice, 

I sent Cliff an email again last night and he should have the 
quote done by Monday. I am off Monday but will try to get 
this taken care of so the quote will be ready for Tuesday. This 
will only be the quote with no formal proposal due to the 
time line and changes to move the endpoint back to Sandia 
Crest. 
Richard Kahn called and wants to talk. The most important 
item is the FCC Licensing process which should be considered 
as soon as possible. At this point you will be lucky to make 
the Sandia Crest side happen before snowfall. Any delays 
with the licensing or discussions will push this into midwinter. 
You still need a tower and that has to be specified for the 
appropriate tower hardware needed to mount the antenna. I 
will run the link again to see if you can get away with a 30 
foot tower to bring the budget down some but the steel is the 
least expensive part of the tower portion of the project. 
I will call Richard if this is needed today but it would be best 
to discuss the project on Tuesday if he is looking for 
additional numbers. I will send you a separate quote for the 
FCC process today if I can stay out of meetings. I will want to 
have a discussion to make sure that everyone is on the same 
page for the offer. I will have to provide you with a detail of 
the proposal offer for the project. The FCC licensing is pretty 
straight forward and we will cover this in the Tuesday 
conversation. Please let me know what time will work for the 
call and if you would like to have anyone else from ACE on 
the call. 

Thanks, 

Richard L. Boltz 
Project NI:unser 
Advanced Communications and Electronics 
2417 Baylor SE 
Abu uer ue MM 87106 

From: BMG 
Sent: Wednesday, August 7, 2013 8:32 AM 
To: Richard Boltz 
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Subject Re: Figures for Links 

Looks like we are going know with this 
Do I need to speak to your management 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 7, 2013, at 8:22 AM, Richard Boltz 
wrote: 

Brice, 

Really sorry but I had to go to the Big guy for the 
tower services on Sandia and it is in his to do list 
for quotes. He owns the business so I can only 
keep asking when. I have the pricing for the rest 
just not the Crest. 

Thanks, 

Richard L. Boltz 
Project Manager 
Advanced Communications and Electronics 
2417 Baylor SE 
Albuquerque, NM 87106 

From: Brice Gordon 

Sent: Tuesday, August 6, 21.11111 
To: Richard Boltz 
Subject: Re: Figures for Links 

hi there 
Have discussed with Jeffrey, link plan etc, do 
you have anything else to forward to him 
regards Brice 

On Wed, Jul 31, 2013 at 3:53 PM, Richard 
Boltz wrote: 
Brice, 

I have the new BOM data back just now and 
am reviewing against the engineering design 
tool data. I will need to work on this tonight 
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and come up with the Sandia Crest side labor 
for ATS. Even a budgetary quote takes a lot 
of work to get everything verified. One 
mistake can be quite costly. 

Thanks, 

Richard L Boltz 
Project Manager 
Advanced Communications and Electronics 
2417 Baylor SE 
Albu uer ue NM 87106 

Brice Gordon 
49 Zorro Ranch Rd 
Stanley, NM 87056 

Ph: 
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