To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)]
From: Jermaine Ruan

Sent: Wed 7/17/2013 B:56:10 PM

Subject: FW: Next steps on Mr. Black's video system

Good day Boss,

Below is an email from Mr. Black’s Audio/Video team requesting permission to perform a site
visit to gather firsthand information to prepare a quote for the new “Video Conference Room™ at
STC. They require a 51,500 travel reimbursement fee if we want to proceed.

Please advise.

Respectfully submutted,

JRuan

From: Connett, Lori [mailto:

Sent: Wednesday, July 17, 2013 2:57 PM

To: Jermaine Ruan

Cc: Fichter, Brian

Subject: RE: Next steps on Mr. Black's video system

Great thanks, We look forward to hearing from you.

Do you have an idea of timeframe that you'd hke us to do the survey?

Regards,

Lori
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Lori Reynolds Connett — Senior Account Manager

89 Bayberry Hill Road | Ridgefield | CT |06877

_ www carouselindustries.com

From: Jermaine Ruan

Sent: Wednesday, July 17, 2013 2:53 PM

To: Connett, Lori

Subject: RE: Next steps on Mr. Black's video system

Hi Lori,

[ will submit the request for approval and have answer no later than Friday.

Regards,

JRuan

From: Connett, Lori [Fl
Sent: Wednesday, July 17, 2013 2:45 PM
To: I

Subject: RE: Next steps on Mr. Black's video system

Hi Jermaine,
Just wanted to follow up with you on this

Please advise your thoughts on next steps
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Thanks,

Lori

Lori Reynolds Connett — Senior Account Manager

89 Bayberry Hill Road | Rudgefield | CT |06877

N carouselindustnies.com

From: Connett, Lori
Sent: Friday, July 12, 2013 5:59 PM

Tum
Subject: Next steps on Mr. black's video system

Hi Jermaine,

We can start with pictures and diagrams if you can send them. We will likely need to do a survey
at some point, and if you feel that’s more efficient, we can just do it that way. There is a
$1,500.00 travel fee reimbursed with your order. Please let me know how you’d like to proceed.

Thanks,

Lori
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Lori Reynolds Connett — Senior Account Manager

89 Bayberry Hill Road | Ridgefield | CT |06877

e | v carouselindustries.com

MNotice:

This email and any attaclments are solely for the use of the intended recipient|s) and may contain informaiion
that is confidential and prohibited from disclosure. If vou have received this email in error, please notifv the
sender immediately and delete this email. Unless expressiy stated in the body of the email, this email is nor
intended io form a binding coniract and complies with our terms and conditions of husiness. Any unanthorized
form of reproduction, disclosure, modification, distribution and/or publication of Carousel Industries email is
strictly prohibited.

EFTA_R1_00440533
EFTA01964012



