To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)]
From: Daphne Wallace
Sent: Mon 7/22/2013 9:24:26 PM

Subject: Re: Lgj

Greetings Sir,

Jimmy says he normally applies deep groves to the concrete, but he can do saw cutting instead at
this same price quoted.

Coloring is not included in this quote, and will be extra. He will work on that quote for you. Do
you have a particular color he should research?

Respectfully,

Daphne

On Mon, Jul 22, 2013 at 4:04 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™> wrote:

does this include saw cutting the concrete and maybe coloring it?

On Mon, Jul 22, 2013 at 4:59 PM, Daphne Wallace _;« wrole:

Greetings Mr. Epstein,
Jimmy's Road quote is detailed below - $ 20, 636.69

Respectfully,
Daphne

---------- Forwarded message -----—-----

From: Jimmy's Concrete F?}
Date: Mon, Jul 22, 2013 at 3:
Subject: Lsj

Hi Daphne

Called Ruben Diaz , left message. Hope to here from him today. Called my supplier for thin set
prices. Waiting on his call.

Price for road:

1)6"x6" road mesh  $1347.84

2)#4 steel 20 pes.

5166.60

3)5 1/2" bar tics

323.55

4)3 1/2" duplex nail 10#

EFTA_R1_00440622
EFTA01964066



$15.00

5)2" wire nails 5#
§7.50

6)Concrete 36 yds.x 180.00
$6480.00
7T)Trucking

$350.00

8)Visqueen 2 - rolls
S350.00

9)Pump truck
S1415.00

10)J/C labor

$ 10491.20

Total- $20,636.69
Jimmy Fraguela
Capital Home Inspection
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

leftrey Epsten
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