
To: Terje Rod-Larne 
From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent Fri 7/12/2013 9:21:31 AM 
Subject: Re: 

and boris will forward you the confirmation of the money , and Gabrile111 as the point person 
from their side. I hope to get you a great deal of money . everytime the 5 million is discussed 
you greatly reduce your chances of more. call when yoiu have a chance 

On Fri, Jul 12, 2013 at 4:44 AM, Terje Rod-Larsen wrote: 

Thanks Jeff! Will send you summary of conference call with G Foundation later today. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacationftiamail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, July 09, 2013 10:34 PM 
To: Terje Rod-Larsen 
Subject: 

hope it is going well 

**************** **************** ****** ********************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by c-mail to jccvacation@gmail com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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