To: firey Epsteinfjeevacation@gmail com]

From:
Sent: Tue 8/13/2013 5:47:36 PM
Subject: Re:

But I need bank statements first . That is what we have been talking about
Sent from my iPad

On Aug 13, 2013, at 1:46 PM, Jeftrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail com> wrote:

i thught that booking pilots , g4, renovaion thropught avioop night be possible.

On Tue, Aug 13, 2013 at 11:34 AM, [ KT -

You said you were working with Rich on the 100k wire options. What is the
question delaying it 7

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@amail.com=
To: =

Sent: Tuesday, August 13, 2013 1:30 PM
Subject: Re:

and?

On Tue, Aug 13, 2013 at 11:29 AM, || KGR o

77 There is only ONE appointment left at the embassy - morning of Aug 23. 1
can't book it without submitting the application first. If someone else books it
first in the next hours or days, that is a problem..
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