to Rihard Ko S

From: Jeffrey Epstein

Sent: Mon 7/28/2013 3:36:25 PM
Subject: Re:
Ok

On Monday, July 29, 2013, Richard Kahn wrote:

yes it is currently insured for 1,665,113
Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

On Jul 29, 2013, at 11:13 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

yes,, 15 it inusred on the way

On Mon, Jul 29, 2013 at 11:08 AM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

attached is original invoice for purchase of ring

i have a 4pm apt to have ring appraised at Sotheby's today
appraisal shall take 30 minutes

is it ok to come by at 3:45pm today to pick up ring?
please advise

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Tracy Penwell
Date: July 29, 2013 10:54:34 AM EDT
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside mformation, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_00442328
EFTA01965100



