
To: Nell= 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 8/7/2013 3:11:58 PM 
Subject: Re: GIV radio RTU repair 

what is happening with the small screen camera issue 

On Wed, Aug 7, 2013 at 9:08 AM, wrote: 

Jeffrey 
The GIV radio RTU has been repaired and is being fedex to Islip for install and functional check. 

Should arrive tomorrow. 
Repair cost was over S12,000 
Gulfstream will present this invoice to Dennis for payment. 
I have not received exact cost, I was told over 12k. 
Thx 
Larry 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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