To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)

From: Melanie Spinella
Sent: Fri 5/31/2013 6:17:23 PM
Subject: FW:

2013 Insurance Certificate.pdf

From: Lisa Graziano

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2013 2:16 PM
To: Melanie Spinella

Subject: RE:

Hey Melanie,
0

I've attached a copy of the Insurance Cerificate for the plane - | did notice they have the
year listed as 1995, however, it's a 2002. | let them know about it and they will change it
and send a new copy by eary next week. Let me know if this is sufficient for Jeffrey. If he
wants the whole policy, | can get it from Jet Aviation - it's like several hundred pages

though. Apparently it incorporates all the planes they operate.

0

As far as purchase date, the Purchase Agreement is dated 8/4/11 and the actual delivery of
the plane was 8/31/11.

0
And there you go.
0
0
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Lisa Graziano | Apollo Investment Corporation
Executive Assistant to John Hannan and Andy Africk

9 West 57th Street

48th FI.

MNew York, NY 10019

(t) 212-515-3457 (f) 212-515-3260

laraziano@apollolp.com

From: Melanie Spinella

Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2013 12:04 PM
To: Lisa Graziano

Subject: FW:

Tomorrow! !

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto; jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2013 11:59 AM

To: Melanie Spinella

Subject:

Can you find out when plane was bought?

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nights reserved
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