To: Lawrence Hraus_

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Mon 5/6/2013 3:49:16 AM

Subject: Re:icalled

tomorow night 1 will send the 25k as soon as you chooose

On Sun, May 5, 2013 at 11:33 PM, Lawrence Krauss _ wrote:

again later.. hope we can speak this week. . will get yvou a screener hink to the movie..

Have been talking to disney.. trying to make wedding simple and fun.. .. with party and food
and associated stuff, total cost for wedding should be around S25K.. T will only accept your
covering the cost if you come, and also go on a few rides with nancy and me (and your
playmates).

when can we talk?

Lawrence M. Krauss

Foundation Professor

Director, Origins Project

Co-Director, Cosmology Initiative
School of Earth and Space Exploration
Arizona State University

PO Box 871404

Tempe, AZ 85287-1404

Email:
Office:
Assistant (Jessica
Origins (Cynthia):
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