
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Tue 12/4/2012 8:15:12 PM 
Subject: Re: LSJ_DSTAR_CK_111612_$3,000.00 

ten minutes 

On Tue, Dec 4, 2012 at 9:14 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

ok 
verifying i will pay invoice of 3,000 

regarding their 13 week proposal in the amount of 15,700 for david from dec 3 2012 thru march 
2nd 2013 my thoughts arc as follows: 

a) 13 weeks = 1207.64 per week or 62,797 annualized 
b) 12 weeks of work if the following holidays are included (christmas day, new years day, martin 

luther & presidents day) = 1,308.33 per week or 68,033 annualized 

are you free to discuss this and some other subjects? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fa 

cell 

On Dec 4, 2012, at 3:05 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

no choice now 

On Tue, Dec 4, 2012 at 4:42 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

attached is david's invoice for a 3 week time period in the amount of 3000 or 
1000 per week 
he was paid for initial scope of work (2 weeks of work) 1750 or 875 per week 
please advise if ok to pay 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fa 

cell 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: oven er 12 4:59:20 'M EST 
To: "Richard Kahn (Gmail Contact)" 

Subject: LSJ_DSTAR_CK_111812_$3,000.00 

FYI 

LSJ, LLC 

St Thomas 
USVI 00802 

Tel: 
Fax: 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationegmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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