
To: Roy Hodges 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 5/24/2013 2:03:56 PM 
Subject: Re: RIB Sport's S-10500/K 

Yes 

On Friday, May 24, 2013, Roy Hodges 

Please find below my communications with Sports, the company that built the boat 
that was in Larrry's photos. 

----- Forwarded mes 
From: Adam Zygowski 
Date: Fri, May 24, 2013 at 9:42 AM 
Subject: Re: RIB S ortis S-10500/K 
To: Roy Hodges 

Hello Roy, 

The Virgin Islands is a very interesting destination! 

Enclosed please find some pictures of boats which we manufactured in the past. 
As you can see we can adjust it to different requirements. 

The boat is able to carry 12 (2+10) persons in the cabin and 6 outside on the "U" bench. 
The luggage may be kept either inside the seats or in the bow compartment, where we can place 

special shelves. 

Inside the cabin we mount cabin heating (I guess it is not needed for you) and A/C. 
Propulsion can be both outboard (up to 4 engines) or single/twin inboard. 
I suppose you would need 2 x Yamaha 350 hp. 
The color of the boat is up to you. 

Please inform about the following info in order to prepare an offer: 
I. Engines - 2 x Yamaha 350 hp? 
2. St. steel rollbar in the aft - is it needed? 
3. Inside the cabin: 
a. A/C? 
b. Benches or single seats? 
c. Bow compartment - how adjusted: sleeping part, luggage, other? 
4. Navigation equipment? 

Best regards 
Adam Zygowski 
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Dnia 24-05-2013 o 14:35:36 Roy Hodges ‹ > napisal(a): 

Good Morning Adam, 

We are on a private island in the United States Virgin Islands. It would 
be mainly used for hauling guests to and from the main island of St. 
Thomas. We would need the ability to haul up to 12 guests with luggage. I 
would like to be able to seat 8 in the cabin. All of the boats we have 
here are powered with Yamaha outboards, we would like to keep it that way 
if possible. The owner of the island saw this picture of one of your boats 
and feels it would be perfect for our needs. 

[image: 0.jpg] 

Please let me know if I can give you any more information. 

Thank You 

Roy Hodges 

On Fri, May 24, 2013 at 2:55 AM, Adam Zygowski > wrote: 

Dear Roy, 

Please inform what would the boat be used for. 
How many seating places inside the cabin, what other arrangement inside, 
what propulsion (outboards, inboards)? 
Generally we can adjust the boat to your requirements. 

Please inform about basic information as above, afterwards I can offer 
different options. 

What country are you from? 

Best regards 
Adam Zygowski 
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Dnia 23-05-2013 o 15:30:05 SPORTIS S.A. ‹ > 
napisal(a): 

From 
To 
Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2013 2:01 PM 
Subject: Pytanie ze strony 

E-mail: 
Telefo 
Trete 

We are interested in buying a S10500/k. I would like to get more 
information if possible? Pricing? Interior photos? Options? 

Thank You 

Roy Hodges 

SPORTIS S.A. 
84-207 Koleczkowo 
ul. Na Dambnik 22 Bciano Poland 
tel 
mo 

www.sportis.com.pl 

http://www.facebook.com/pages/**SPORTIS/151189274950385<http://www.faccbook.com/va 
gcs/SPORT1S/151189274950385> 

http://twitter.com/#!/sportis **sa <http://twitter.com/#!/sportis sa> 
https://plus.google.com/** I 09174365046263030394<hups://plus.google.com/10917436504626 

3030394> 
 ** ** 

Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdansku, 
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VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 
kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloici oplacony. 
Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdatisk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 
Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
 ** 4, 4,

SPORTIS S.A. 
84-207 Kolcczkowo 
ul. Na Dambnik 22 Bo'ano Poland 
tel 
mob 

www.sportis.com.pl 

http://www.facebook.com/pages/SPORTIS/151189274950385 
http://twitter.com/#!/sportis sa 
https://plus.google.com/109174365046263030394 

Rejestracja: S4d Rejonowy Gdatisk Pelnoc Oddzial w Gdansku, 
VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 
kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloici oplacony. 
Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdatisk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 
Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

Roy & Stephanie Hodges 

■*****************************■E **** ******* **************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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