
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent: Fri 11/30/2012 9:33:43 PM 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Carpet - Sacco 

yes 

On Fri, Nov 30, 2012 at 4:00 PM, Richard Kahn ‹ > wrote: 

They can only install Thursday or Friday of next week 
Is that ok? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Kim Steube" < 
Date: November 30, 2012 3:58:11 PM EST 
To: "Richard Kahn" <richardkahn12 mail corn> 
Cc: >, "Rich Barnett" 

Subject: RE: Dining Room Proforma Invoice 

Hi Rich, 
I was unable to move things around on Tuesday. Can we install on Thurs or Friday? 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TH FLOOR 
N Y NY 10012 
T: F: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Friday, November 30, 2012 3:18 PM 
To: Kim Steube 
Cc: Rich Barnett 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma Invoice 

Any update on schedule for next week 
Thanks 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York New York 10022 
tel 

On Nov 29, 2012, at 10:00 AM, Kim Stcubc wrote: 

Hi Sarah, 
My installer is currently booked on Monday-Wednesday. I'm still trying to move things 
around for Tuesday but I won't be able to confirm until tomorrow. 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TH FLOOR 
NEW YORK NY 10012 
T: F. 

From: 
Sent: Thursday, November 29, 2012 9:41 AM 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: Kim Steube; Rich Barnett 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma Invoice 

Please let me know if early next week works for the install as we will need to 
organize movers to remove the furniture from the room, unless the installers can 
move the furniture? 

On Nov 28, 2012, at 4:06 PM, Richard Kahn ‹ > wrote: 

i just sent wire for balance due in the amount of 10,765.50 
Jeffrey prefers Monday or Tuesday for installation as he may be in 
town on Dcc 6th 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York, New York 10022 
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cell 

On Nov 26, 2012, at 10:55 AM, Kim Steube wrote: 

Actually can we switch to the 6" instead? 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TH FLOOR 
NEW YORK NY 10012 
T: 

From: Kim Steube 
Sent: Monday, November 26, 2012 10:53 AM 
To: 'Richard Kahn' 
Cc: 
Subject: RE: Dining Room Proforma Invoice 

Hi Rich, 
I hope you had a great Holiday! 
The install will take 1 day. Can we schedule for next Tuesday 4th ? My 
head mechanic is out this week and I prefer that I use my best crew on 
your jobs. 
let me know if the 4th works for you. 

Thanks! 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TH FLOOR 
NEW YORK NY 10012 
T: F: 
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From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2012 4:34 PM 
To: Kim Steube 
Cc: 
Subject: Re: Dining Room Proforma Invoice 

i will send money on monday 
please let us know what dates next week work for installation 
is this a I day install? 
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thank you 
happy thanksgiving 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 

New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

On Nov 21, 2012, at 12:24 PM, Kim Steube wrote: 

Hi Rich, 
The Dining room carpet just arrived. Please see invoice attached for 
payment. 
I will coordinate an installation date with Sarah next week. 

Have a great Thanksgiving! 

KIM STEUBE 
520 BROADWAY 
6TH FLOOR 
N W Y RK N 10012 
T: F: 
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The information contained in this communication is 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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