From: Jeffrey Epstel
Sent: Wed 11/7/2012 8:13:18 PM

Subject: Re: Josephine from Coral Bay Garden Center

no

On Wed, Nov 7, 2012 at 4:12 PM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

1 just received two invoices totaling 6,561.50 broken down as follows:
1000.00 - consulting (250 x 4)
5561.50 - supplies such as mulch, compost, plant material, insecticide, seeds, ete.

15 this ok to pay?
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstemn

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereot 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail. com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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