
To: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Fri 4/26/2013 9:01:09 PM 
Subject Re: Reminders 

do it with chiller, 2, this will last until sept 3, i talked to jean , i akscd last month for danny to 
be spoken to , he is too expensice 

On Fri, Apr 26, 2013 at 2:58 PM, Richard Kahn <IMME=> wrote: 

a) AD Winston Chiller 
Cost of Project with Chiller 350,000 
Cost w/o Chiller 237,900 

b) Karen & Brice - still paid as consultants to TTR at $15,235 per month or $182,820 
annualized vs their prior salary of $74,250 each 

c) Eliminating IC payroll and moving everyone to LSJ Employees 
-issue is that carlos and danny receive health benefits on Isj employees 
-carlos would receive insurance via wife and be reimbursed / danny?? 

d) Durable Power of Attorney - when i spoke with Darren he believes he already has one on file -
I asked him to retrieve it and send you a copy for review 

e) Sarah payroll! / SLK Designs 

t) 2 Laptop Computers at LSJ from NY that Roy and Stephanie do not need 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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