
To: Richard Kahn 
Front Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 10/31/2012 9:20:02 PM 
Subject Re: Gotham Awards Chairs 

Foundation to Gotham 

On Wednesday, October 31, 2012, Richard Kahn wrote: 

Please advise if ok to pay Peggy invoice in the amount of 7,239.60 
if so from what entity? jce, hbrk, enhanced.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell-

Begin forwarded message: 

From: IFP Business Office •fl 
Date: October 31, 2012 3:59:27 PM EDT 
To: Allison Reddington c

Cc: sponsorship 
Subject: RE: Gotham Awards Chairs 

Hello Allison and Richard: 

Richard, thank you so very kindly for your support. 

I have attached a quote for you from Party Rental (the same vendor who supplied them 
last year). 

As for color, Party Rental would like you to know that the same brown chairs are no 
longer available... and the replacement is Fruitwood with brown velvet cushion 

Mitchell 

Mitchell Micich 
Deputy Director 
!FP & Filmmaker Magazine 

From: Allison Reddington [mailto: 
Sent: Friday, October 26, 2012 2:31 PM 

EFTA_R1_00466378 
EFTA01978987



To: IFP Business Office 
Subject: Gotham Awards Chairs 

Dear Richard and Mitch, 

Hope you are both well. 

I would like to introduce you two to one another as Jeffrey has graciously offered to 
pay the $8,000 for the ballroom chairs for the Gotham Awards. 

Peggy spoke about having dark brown wood chairs with brown velvet cushions. 

Please let me know if you require any further assistance. 

Best, 
Allison 

Allison Reddington 

Assistant to Peggy Siegal 
Peggy Siegal Company 
750 Lexington Avenue 
Sth Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation6igmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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