
To: Philip Michael Philip Mic 
Cc: Jeffrey Epsteinbeevacation©gmall.com]; Glenn Davi 
From: Peggy Siegal 
Sent: Mon 11/5/2012 9:45:06 PM 
Subject: Re: Annette Siegal's estate. 2nd email on Nov. 1st 

Phil. I did call this morning and your assistant had no information. She 
assured me some would get back to me. Possibly you can give me a "heads up" as 
to when we can speak? Thank you. Peggy 

Mobil 
Office 
Peggy Sie al Comoan 

 Original Message 
From: "Peggy Siegal" 
Date: Mon, 5 Nov 2 
To: Phil Philip 
Michaels 
Reply-To: 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein<jeevacation@gmail.com>; Glenn Davis 
Subject: Re: Annette Siegal's estate. 2nd email on Nov. s 

will call you this morning. What is best time? What is going on. 

Mother died almost two years ago. (mid-Febuary). Does it always take so long or 
is my brother's lawyer trying to ignore us and hope we will give up? I assume 
there are laws....can we not send a letter and close this? 

Thank you. Peggy 

I did ask a few times, what you plan on charging me. 
Peggy Sie al Com an 
Offic 
Mobil 

 Original Messag  
From: "Peggy Siegal"
Date: Sat, 3 Nov 201 
To: Philip Michaels Philip 
Michaels 
Reply-To 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein<jeevacation@gmail.com›; Glenn Davis 
Subject: Re: Annette Siegal's estate. 2nd email on Nov. st 

Phil: I left a message for you this afternoon. I was told you were in the 
office. If you can not update me over the weekend....please tell me when I 
should call you Monday. 

I also asked what your fee will be. 

I can only assume, because we are now into November, that there must be some 
government deadlines...on closing the estate. 
Please advise asap. 
Thank you. Peggy 
Peggy 
Office 
Mobil 

 Original Message 
From: "Peggy Siegal" 
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Date: Fri, 2 Nov 2012 19:36:46 
To: Philip Michaels ; Philip 
Michaels 
Reply-To• 
Cc: Jeffrey ps ein<jeevaca ion gmail.com>; Glenn Davis 
Subject: Annette Siegal's estate 

It is now November 1st. 

What is going on? 
Please send some info or update. 
Thank you. Peggy Siegal 

Peggy 
Offic 
Mobil 
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