
To: 
Cc: Richard Kahn[
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Thur 11/1/2012 5:44:32 PM 
Subject Re: Desk from Paris 

i will only pay when it arrives, ignore him 

On Thu, Nov I, 2012 at 12:37 PM, wrote: 

Frederic told me on Tueday that the desk has been shipped. 
He is asking for the balance for the desk of Euros 20 000. I sent to Rich who wants you to 
confirm that it is ok to pay before he does so. 

The only proof we have is his word. I have requested confirmation from shipper 
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