To: in[ieevacation@gmail.com]
From:

Sent: Wed 8/13/2014 2:54:45 PM

Subject: Re: Hotel Europe Minsk

| have cancelled the Minsk hotel. We will receive credit in about a week. Do you still wi
to go to the Belarus consulate for your visa? (Larry found an engineer that can work the
Belarus, but we need to get the engineer and pilots visas also...) Please advise if we cont
process for visas. .

On Aug 13, 2014, at 8:29 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@ gmail.com> wrote:

cancel

On Wed, Aug 13, 2014 at 4:47 AV T -

Please see below and advise. We have prepaid $9350 USD. Today is still within
cancellation policy (2 days prior to check in) Do we accept the credit of 6715
Euro when we have exact date of vour reservation?

Begin forwarded message:

From: Hotel Europe <reservation@hoteleurope. by>
Subject: Re: To Nataile Prokopchuk

Date; August 13, 2014 at 4:.41:59 AM EDT
ro:
Hello| N

we can refund money 6 715 euro.

When you will have exact date, we will make a new reservation
for Mr.Epstein.

Let us know your decision.

Best regards,
Olga Manyuk
Reservation Department
Hotel Europe

28, Internatsionalnaya Str.
220030 Minsk, Belarus
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Or:

Kowmy: "Hotel Europe” <reservation@hoteleurope. by=>
OrnpaenenHsie: BropHuk, 12 Aeryct 2014 r 21:00:32
Tema: Re: To Nataile Prokopchuk

Hello Natalie. | know we have prepaid for a suite for Mr. Jeffrey Epstein
starting on Aug. 15th for 17 nights. We are still in the process
of securing a visa for Jeffrey so he will not arrive this Friday. |
do not want to compromise his visa application. |s it possible
to get a credit for unused nights even after the check in date
of Aug. 15th? | do not think he will be coming now until end of
Aug. Please advise what you think we should do. | know
your cancellation policy is 2 days prior to arrival.

Thank inu,

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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