
To: 
From: 111,1 ein 
Sent Thur 9/9/2010 9:33:57 AM 
Subject Re: 

call me 561 601 4569 

On Tu, Sep 9, 2010 at 1:38 AM, wrote: 

I need authority to move forward and get the cabanas done...In the past that has worked well 
....it seems that sarah and shelly's direction may not be what you want....you and I might need 
to talk directly.. 

I think we should get some 3d renderings going so you can visualize what I am 
proposing....about 2500 dollars cach....might need two 

One to start off with 

Heard you talked with MB today....this location on 58th is perfect. 

We have burnt through the retainer...so please have Rich send us another 15k please. Matt has 
been in touch with him and he has all the back up....he requested pay stubs so as to clarify the 
hourly rates....my acct is sending that to him tomorrow or friday. 
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