
To: Rich Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 10/27/2010 5:46:23 PM 
Subject Re: Ryan Dionne 

no way. 

On Wed, Oct 27, 2010 at 12:54 PM, Rich Kahn <a wrote: 

Ryan sent an invoice for 9,375 which is made up of the following: 

a) Last week of work 3,125 (10/11-10/15) 

b) 2 weeks severance per GM 6,250 

I told GM that two week's severance was crazy and she said on Monday she was going to speak with 
you. 

Please advise. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cell 

From: Gmax [mailto 
Sent: Wednesday, October 27, 2010 10:14 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: Wire transfer 

I'll call him 

--- Original Message — 
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From: Rich Kahn a ,
To: Gmax 
Sent: Wed Oct 27 10:12:49 2010 
Subject: FW: Wire transfer 

Rich Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite IOF 
New York NY 10065 
tel 

fax M Icell 

--Original Message—
From: Ryan Dionne [milt°
Sent: Wednesday, October 27, 2010 10:12 AM 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Wire transfer 

Rich. 

Please let me know when the wire will be sent and if it will include my 
last weeks pay plus the two weeks severance for a total of $9.375. 

Thank you, 

Ryan 
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

************** ********************************************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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