
To: Rich Kahn[ 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Tue 11/23/2010 3:25:40 PM 
Subject Re: funding your personal account 

yes 

On Tue, Nov 23, 2010 at 11:17 AM, Rich Kahn IMI > wrote: 

Do I have your permission to fund your account from FTC JP Morgan with 1,000,000 as the 
balance in account is 157,993 and I have funding request for GII of 213,425 to pay. The last 
time we funded was on 11/8/2010. 

Rich Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

tel 

fax 

cel 

**************** 304,istis***************** ********************* 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. 
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