
To: Emad Hanna 
From: Jeevacation 
Sent: Wed 8/25/2010 11:11:30 PM 
Subject: Re: RE: RE: 

ask st Thomas concrete to buy 100 yards and get it to the east end of st John 

Sent from my iPhone 

.: :" 
On Aug 25, 2010, at 1:06 PM, "Emad Hanna" wrote: 

> Jeffrey, 

> St. Thomas Concrete sells per yard $ 198.50 and they give a $ 10 
> discount for credit card and $ 15 discount for cash and check payment. 

> • The $ 350 price Gary tells you per yard includes the steel tie wire and 
> labor as well. He informed me he will breakout his calculation and send 
> it to me in the morning. 

> • He also informed me that the concrete can only sit in a truck for 1 hour 
> so it would not be possible to get it to LSJ. 

> Thank you 

> • Emad Hanna 
> Project Controller 
> HBRK Associates 

• Original Message 
> From: Jeevacation (mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com) 
> Sent: Wednesday, August 25, 2010 3:35 PM 
> To: Emad Hanna 
> Subject: Re: RE: 

> I asked you to call st Thomas concrete for s per yard cost „do it now 

> • Sent from my iPhone 

> on Aug 25, 2010, at 12:02 PM, "Emad Hanna" 
> wrote: 

>> Jeffrey, 

>> I just spoke to Gary about the cement blocks. 
>> 
>> 
> 

He informed that Home Depot does not have 
two 

the cement blocks with the 

» holes in them which is the one they need to use. 

>> Also Home Depot gives a 15 % discount on purchases of $ 2,500 or more. 
>> 
>> I will see what I can do when I get to LSJ about getting some kind of 
>> discount from all the vendors that we do a lot of business with. 
>> 
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» I will also sit down with Gary and have him break down the cost per 
> yard 
>> of cement and go through those numbers so I can understand why the 
> cost 
>> is at $ 350 per yard. 

» Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
>> Project Controller 
>> HBRK Associates 
>> 

>> 

>> 
>> 

 Original Message 
>> From: Jeevacation [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com) 
>> Sent: Wednesday, August 25, 2010 1:03 PM 
» To: Emad Hanna 
» Subject: 
>> 
» Did you price the cement in st Thomas?? 
>> 
» Sent from my iPhone 
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