
To: jeevacation©gmail.com[jeevacation©gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeeyacation©gmail.com] 
From: emad henna 
Sent Wed 7/6/2011 7:53:04 PM 
Subject: Re: change orders 

Jeffrey, 
Here is what I have on the pricing. 

The 14 LED lights quoted below totaling $24,290 (Jack from AMEX quoted at $11,993.10 per 
the specs provided by Gary) minimal shipping cost via Tropical 
The Diamond Britc a total of 440 bags quote from the pool contractor delivered to STT is 
$20,942.50 (jack priced out at $15,505.60 and estimate 1 full 20' container via Tropical is around 
$2,600 which would total $17,650.60 delivered to STT) 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 
Project Controller 
HBRK Associates 

On Jul 5, 2011, at 3:52 PM, Gary Kerney wrote: 

220 bags for flagpole 
220 for main, smaller but redo takes more 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 5, 2011, at 3:49 PM, "Jeffrey Epstein" leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

I want to know quantity, of diamond brite, please. forward to emad 

On Tue, Jul 5, 2011 at 3:34 PM, Gary Kerney 
wrote: 
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Jeffrey 

Attached are the proposed change orders from pool contractor 

Summery 

Main pool 

# 6 chip plaster $15,550 

# 7 blue plaster material and shipping 10,471.25 
apply plaster 18,899.75 

# 9 add 7 LED lites(only if we replaster) 12,145 

Flagpole pool 

# 5 blue plaster material and shipping $10,471.25 

#10 add 7 new LED lites 12,145 

NOTE: Bart says we can change existing to500 watt wide angle LED iltes 

Blue on the main pool and white on the blue plastered flagpool 

The blue plaster is on hold pending the decision whether to do one or both 
pools.we can get it from fla. in a week 

From: Wendy Lockman (mailto: 
Sent: Tue 7/5/2011 2:58 PM 
To: j3art Wolterman; Gary Kemey 
Subject: change orders 

Please let me know if you have any further questions. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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