T ceaile e Jonor

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 10/28/2010 8:56:04 PM
Subject: Re:

oh ok,, , martin novak also agreed that canceling it was the right thing to do

On Thu, Oct 28, 2010 at 4:53 PM, Cecile de Jongh _wmtc:
OK but they agreed not to require the $25K now.

Warm regards,

Cecile

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 28, 2010, at 4:47 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™> wrote:

lets sign the contract,, give them the 25k | and tell them we will decide on dates.
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.

EFTA_R1_00472288
EFTA01982927



