To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Cecile de

Jongh (G
.
jeevacation@gmail com[jeevacation@gmail .com)

From: Emad Hanna

Sent: Fri 211/2011 7:33:10 PM

Subject: RE: Fuel Truck

I'm working on it and should have something to you by Monday

Thank you

Eemad Hanna

Project Controller

HBRK Associates

From: Cecile de Jongh [mailto: | GTGcGNGGEEEE

Sent: Friday, February 11, 2011 2:30 PM

To:
o I - o jox.ocationOpmlLcom

Subject: Re: Fuel Truck

Also, | will wait for more info from Emad on the truck before | send the
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specs to VIPA. They will tell us the required dimensions of the platform.

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete all copies.

From:
To:
Cc:
Sent: Fri, February 11, 2011 2:10:04 PM
Subject: Re: Fuel Truck

jeevacation@gmail.com

Hi Cecil,

Micolas Van Heurch from Air Center Helicopter, has a brother-in-law who owns Rodriguez Auto parts and
the Gas station on St Thomas, his name is KeeKe, he knows Mr. Maldanado at Esso very well since he
purchases car fuel for his gas station in quantity from him,.,.Keeke spoke to Mr Maldanado today and
was receptive to selling us fuel,.

Mr. Maldanado is going to contact me Monday or Tuesday, he is checking to see if his fueling contract
enables him to sell Jet fuel to General Aviation aircraft,. currently his contract is for Airlines only,. He was
very nice and willing to help us out,. | will keep you posted,.

also,.

Fuel truck dimensions estimate,:

40 to 45 feet long, and roughly 7 feet wide, this would be a 5000 gallon tanker truck to hold Jet fuel,.
depending on truck manufacture, the size may vary in length. Emad is researching fuel truck options,.

thanks,
Larry
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