
To: aitcom[jeevacation@gmail.com]: Je vacation[jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent: n :34:24 PM 
Subject: Re: 430 update 

Craig: 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Fri, 24 Feb 2012 06:33:08 -0700 
To: Lvjet 
Subject: Re: 430 update 

send me his number 

On Fri, Feb 24, 2012 at 6:30 AM, Lvjet 

Jeffrey, 
what time would you like Craig to call you? 

wrote: 

I received the email below from Craig this morning,. the control issue needs a firm 
price, Bell indicates there have been two 430 parted out and bell needs to confirm 
part number for compatibility install on our 430,,,these controls may be bought 
according to Dave Burch (Bell) $20k or less,. Craig needs firm price and is willing to 
use PremiAir commission to pay for this, I hope to a firm price today, so our range is 
20 - 60k. I do not know if we are bordering on frustration of seller since he as lost 
the controls, and Mich is telling Craig its our problem since its a fire sale,.and seller 
himself is flaky, 

my opinion, we get the most out of Craig for controls, and close this deal,. I'm way 
ahead in value, even if i need to shop harder for dual controls„„I don't need the 
duals in 430 to fly, since its dual auto pilot and single IFR pilot certifified, I want to 
duals at some point, but its not urgent now,. just for current deal,. 
New controls firm price is $62,000.00 from Bell, Craig offered $20k to close, but 
needs confirmation that price is good,.may be able to sqeek another 10k, maybe 

Larry, 
All is ok, I'm getting frustrated with these guys simply. I can't get fast, 

concise answers so I need to play hard ball with them and say get on with it. 

The image of the floats was wrong so I'm told so now Owen Dennis needs to 
personally go over to take picture and check everything, he can't do this until 
Saturday. I still have no price from Dave Burch also, I hope to hear back soon 
from him. 
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Give me a couple of hours to bang heads together, I will have answers! 

Kind regards 

Craig Lammiman 
Aircraft Sales Manager 
PremiAir Global 
Mob: +44 (0) 7834 534295 
Tel: +44 (0) 1252 555904 

***************** ********** ****************** ************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any pan thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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