To: jeevacation@gmail com[jesvacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: _

Sent: Fri 9/2/2011 6:56:51 PM

Subject: Tony/heli ride

Larry was in touch with the heli people regarding Tony and his girlfriend riding in heli to
Hamptons and back. If the heli took them back to the city, it would cost you an additional $7,200;
they charge $7200 each way. Do you still want the heli to bring them back to the city, or should
we look mto alternative ways to get them back?

Begin forwarded message:

From: NN

Subject: Fw: Saturday, September 3rd
Date: September 2, 2011 2:46:32 PM EDT

To: I
Reply-To:

Yes its double if tony rides back

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T

From: "R. Masi" <[ | i

Date: Fri, 2 Sep 2011 14:44:00 -0400
To: -

ReplyTo: < WuS————
Ce: < I -

Subject: RE: Saturday, September 3rd

Hi Larry,

| work in the flight operations office, alongside Dan and Joanna., We have our Summer
Rate, as well as our regular charter rate. The summer rate for the Hamptons would be
$7200 each way, that includes landing fees. The only thing that would increase the cost
would be tax, and “wait time”. The “wait time" would be if passengers are late, at a
$1000 per hour.

| want to give you as accurate a quote as possible. Are these the numbers that you
were originally quoted?

If we were to pick Mr Epstein, and additional passengers from the West 30" Street
Heliport and go to East Hampton, that would be the $7200 rate. Bringing anyone back
from East Hampton would be the same rate for returm.

| hope this answered your questions. Please let us know if we can be of any
assistance.

Thank You,

Bob Masi
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Associated Aircraft Group, Inc

mem
Sent: Friq:lai| item r02, 2011 2:15 PM

To:
Subject: Re: Saturday, September 3rd

this looks good.,.

could you provide me cost for this trip for one way drop?

and also, if we decide to have two people join Mr. Epstein for the ride to east hampton,
and then drop them off back at west side pad, how much additional will that be?
thanks

Larry

In a message dated 9/2/2011 9:16:51 A.M. Eastern Daylight Time, _

writes;
Hi Larry,

We have cancelled the return for you and modified the manifest for the pick up.
Please review for accuracy.

Thanks,

From:
Sent: Friday, September 02, 2011 8:38 AM
To:
Subject: Re: Saturday, September 3rd

Hello Dan,

final update for trip tomorrow,.for Jeffrey Epstein,.

Depart West Side heli pad with two passengers to East Hampton,.
-Pax 1 Jeffrey Epstein
-Pax 2
Cancel return trip.,,.they will drive back to NY City,.

if you could send final trip itinerary that would be great,.

thanks again,.

Larry Visoski

Freedom Air International Inc

ps: our account gives us a 10% discount if you can make sure when they do the
invoice its included, | will use AAG money on account under my name and
company name of Freedom Air International, Inc,.

thank you,

Larry

In a message dated 8/31/2011 2:35:52 P.M. Eastern Daylight Time,
*\ writes:

Hi Larry,
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Please send me all the details for Mr. Epstein's flight this Saturday,
September 3",

Thank you,

Dan Frost

Associated Aircraft Group, Inc.

AAG is a trademark of Sikorsky Fractional Sales, Inc.

A message to AAG's valued Charter Customers. "By submitting this
charter booking confirmation, Customer agrees to AAG's standard
terms and conditions, which can be found on AAG's website"”

http:www lyvaag com/enms
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