To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; jefirey epsteinfjeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Woed 1/5/2011 4:56:27 PM

Subject: RE: Landmark

Gary is correct as you gave me approval in mid December to pay his November invoice and | mistakenly
did not pay
When we spoke yesterday | thought that funds were sent

| apologize as this was my error

Please advise

Rich Kahn

HBRE Assoclates Inc.

Mew Yorlk, NY 18865

tel
fax

cel

From: jeffrey epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, January 05, 2011 11:04 AM

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Fwd: Landmark

1 thought you told me nov was paid

Begin forwarded message:
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Date: January 5, 2011 11:03:58 AM EST

To: "Jeffrey Epstein” <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Subject: Landmark

Rich has not paid landmark invoices for November and December. Please have him process.
Sent from my iPhone
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