
To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; bellaklein 
Cc: Jeffre E stein 'eevacation@gmail.com] 
From: 
Sent Wed 10/17/2012 2:13:21 AM 
S Re: Ka na Chase Visa statement October 11 2012 

Hi 
attached please find confirmed charges. 
Thank you. 

On Oct 16, 2012, at 11:59 AM, bellaklein wrote: 

> • Dear 
> Please confirm charges on your Visa card, 

› Iiiiiillru,
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