To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)
Cc: Larry Visoski

From: emad hanna

Sent: Wed 7/6/2011 2:33:14 PM

Subject: Re: Mercedes Tires

[ will check the goodyear.
I did not coordinate this purchase with Larry. | have the invoice in front of we purchased these
tires at Mercedes-Benz of Palm Beach.

Thank you

Emad Hanna

Project Controller
HERK Associates

Mew

On Jul 6, 2011, at 10:28 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

ok,, check goodyear triple treads wiht cbhanced sidewalls. did you ccoordibate
the tire purchase with larry, didn;t we get these tires at another tire place?

On Wed, Jul 6, 2011 at 10:25 AM, emad hanna <emad.hanna0l & gmail.com> wrote:

Jeffrey,
4 tires were purchased on 10-28-08 costing $312.50 each and the mileage at the
time was 19,205

Current milage 1s 35,189 which means we got 15,984 miles from those tires.

Janusz dropped the car off today at the Benz dealer and was informed those exact tires
may be a bit difficult to find an exact replacement for but they will search and let
us know what they come up with.

Thank you

Emad Hanna
Project Controller
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HBRK Associates
301 East 66th St
Suite 10F
New York, NY 10065
Cell (340) 642-8763
LSJ Office (340) 775-8127
St. Thomas Office (340) 775-2525
NY Office (646) 862-4815

Fax (646) 350-0221
emad.hannal1@amail.com
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. It you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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