
To: jeevacati • " @gmail.com] Jeffrey Epsteinbeeyacation©gmail.com] 
Cc: Rich Kah 
From: 
Sent Wed 3/23/2011 6:36:19 PM 
Subject Re: Peggy Siegel and Cannes 

will do... 
On Mar 23, 2011, at 2:32 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

it cannot be done that way,,, tell her to talk tome 

On Wed, Mar 23, 2011 at 2:30 PM, Lesley Groff <lesley.jec@gmail.com> wrote: 

Peggy Siegel has said you have agreed to pay for her room at the Cannes Film 
Festival again this year. Shc says she is getting the same room at the Carlton as 
last year and paying the same rate. She asked if Rich could please call the Carlton 
and pay for her room because they need payment as soon as possible. She will be 
staying for 2 weeks. 

Do you give Rich permission to pay for Peggy's room at the Carlton for Cannes? 
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