To: jeevacation@gmail. com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; —
Cc: jeevacation@gmail . com[jeevacation@gmail.comn];, Gary

Kermey[gkerney@landmarklandco.com]
From: emad hanna

Sent: Wed 8/29/2011 4:23:57 PM
Subject: Re: Containerised RO

Brice,

The contamerized Equipment & Accessories totaled 5154,330
Supply and Install Intake & Pump House Equip $16,000

Supply and Install Feed Lines including cable & electric $32,200

Total of the contract $202.530
We also paid

$1,500 for stallation of 100 ft 8 inch HDPE pipe for intake
$1,952 to install buried 6 inch Asahi gate valve
$3,087 for mobihization for start up and training

So what are they exactly going to be taking for the proposed $40,0007 just the contamner with the

Thank you

Emad Hanna
Project Controller
HBRK Associates
301 East 66th St

Suite 10F
Cell

LSJ Office |!!| “!—ELT

St. Thomas Office (340) 775-2525
NY Office (646) B62-4815
Fax (646) 350-0221

Mew

On Jun 29, 2011, at 11:44 AM, brice gordon wrote:

Jeftrey

TSG has made an offer of 40K, for the containerized RO,

In simple terms they would like to take delivery in Sept, 10,000 deposit now, the
rest when they pick it up

waiting for Emad to confirm what was the actual cost for the unit
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Brice Gordon
Little Saint James
USVI

Phone;
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