
To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[eevacation@gmail.com] 
Cc: Rich Kahnfokensenbliteeeeeietentemi 
From: Gary Kerney 
Sent: Tue 7/5/2011 5:18:17 PM 
Subject: FW: 
Epstein invoice, 01-18-11.pdf 

Jeffrey 

Attached is a copy of the invoice from Landmark for reimbrusment for their last payment to me for January. I 
then went direct to you starting Feburary. 

The invoice has not been paid and I would appreciate if you would advise Rich to process it. 

Gary 

From: Sharon Myers 
Sent: Tue 7/5/2011 12:23 PM 
To: Gary Kerney 
Subject: 

Sharon C .11yers 
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