To: jeevacation@gmail com[jeevacation@amail.com]; Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Rich Kahn

Sent: Mon 12/6/2010 11:37:56 PM

Subject: RE: Tax id

Ok that | should try to get him for the 120k best base or 132.5k if he does not budge?

If he says yes do you want him to go to New Mexico with you?

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, December 06, 2010 6:33 PM

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Re: Tax id

ok

On Mon, Dec 6, 2010 at 4:14 PM, Rich Kahn < INNEGEGEGE - 01

Just spoke with Scott and communicated offer to him as follows:

85,000 salary with health insurance benefits, 401k of 3% and potential for bonus

Scott was very turned off by offer. I kept him speaking for a while and he countered 85k and reduced his
number {rom 180k to 132 5k which is the middle of the two numbers. He said he would agree to that with
the provision for a review every 3 months. 1 think he would go for 120k as well.

Here is my opinion even though it is unsolicited. He is very smart and can bring a lot to the table. He
mentioned that he can clean up Google scarches very easily that we currently are paying a consultant to
do. Considering that we paid May 100k and she was terrible for an extra 20k I would recommend we try
him for 3 months, The monthly cost for you with him on payroll and health benefits at 120,000 per annum
15 11,500 per month. I believe for 3 months you can get 60 hours a week of work from him which would
equate to an hourly rate 544.23 per hour,

He is still at the premises at 301 east 66™ street and is awaiting your feedback.

Please advise.
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Rich Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

381 East 66th Street, Suite 10f

o G

From: Jeevacation [mailto:jecvacation@ gmail .com
Sent: Monday, December 06, 2010 3:01 PM
To: Rich Kahn
Subject: Re: Tax id

Give her10 thousand

Sorry for all the typos Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 6, 2010, at 2:44 PM, "Rich Kahn" < |_1?—'- wrote:
Yes itis a 501(c)3 (see below)
Any thoughts on Scott — he is still in our office waiting to hear

Please advise

Unique Projects
[Dance]

http://nystatcarts.org/aso/oncTorg 1d=3159&letter=U&scarch_type=letter&page=1&offse
(

= Mailing Address
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246 West 38th Street, 8th floor
New York, NY 10018-5805
Phone (I

Inaugurated in 1988, Unique Projects is a program created and administered by
Pentacle/DanceWorks. It is a 501(¢)3 nonprofit corporation which provides a tax-
exempt umbrella and technical assistance on a project-by-project basis to artists
and companies whose work is of high caliber and for whom the program's specific
structure is appropriate.

Serving
Artists
New York City Region

Bronx, Kings (Brooklyn), New York (Manhattan), Queens, Richmond (Staten Island)
Counties

Services Provided
Artists
Professional Development/Training
Arts Professionals

Professional Support, Technology Support

Rich Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

381 East e&6th Street, Suite 16F

New York, NY 18865
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From: Jeevacation [mailto:jeevacationm gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, December 06, 2010 2:42 PM
To: Rich Kahn
Subject; Fwd: Tax id

Check that's it a 501¢3

Sorry for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: TG
Date: December 6, 2010 2:00:33 PM EST
To: "Jeffrey Epstein" <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Tax id
Reply-To: i ———

13-3085289
Unique Projects, Inc
Let me know if you need any other information

Hope ur having a happy monday
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments.
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