
To: jeevacationagmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Gary 
Kerney[gkerney@landmarklandco.com] 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein(jeevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wed 5/4/2011 5:48:47 PM 
Subject: Re: gary payments 

gary your wire was sent today 
Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 
tel 646-862-4811 
fax 
cell 

On May 4, 2011, at 1:46 PM, Gary Kerney wrote: 

Sony to bother you with this 
I asked Rich to pay me by the first when I send a invoice in the middle of the month 

last month I got wired funds the 5th of april for March 
I haven't got april payment yet 
please ask him to pay me by the first monthly 

Thanks 

Gary 
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