
To: jeevacation maitcom "eevacation gmail.comj: brice gordon 
Cc: Craig Marti 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Wed 5/16/2012 6:32:30 PM 
Subject: re: Zorro Stucco 

I am now in receipt of three different invoices from the same vendor over the last two weeks and 
do not understand what has changed from one bid to the next. 
I think with all these emails flying around it would be easier for everyone to follow if you could 
write in the body of your email why the bids have changed. 
We all know Jeffrey becomes uneasy when being presented with changing numbers... 

1) First Bid - received by you on may 3rd - base amount before taxes & bond 69,600 
2) Second Bid - received by you on may 16th - base amount before taxes & bond 72,900 
3) Third Bid - received by you on may 16th - base amount before taxes & bond 77,900 

Please help me understand all these changes in addition to if this work was bid by multiple 
vendors and what their pricing was. 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc 

tel 
fax 
cell 

On May 16, 2012, at 11:19 AM, brice gordon wrote: 

please disregard earlier e mail, this is the latest bid after sight visit 

 Forwarded message 
From: Transito Rael gransitoraellalesfiledw.com>
Date: Tue, May 8, 2012 at 5:22 PM 
Subject: Zorro Ranch 
To: brice gordon <bgordon.lsj@gmail.com>

Brice, 

Here arc the changes you requested. 

EFTA_R1_00502537 
EFTA02004254



Let me know if you have any questions. 

Thanks, 
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Transito Rael 

Estimator 

Cell 

Fax 

Office 

Brice Gordon 
Little Saint James 
USVI 
Phone: 
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