
To: jeevacation@gmail.com[jeevacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinueevacation@gmail.com] 
From: Emad Hanna 
Sent: Mon 2/14/2011 5:05:15 PM 
Subject: RE: LSJ Excavator Rental 

Jeffrey, 

He is willing to drop the $ 300 mobilization and drop the hourly to $ 165 which will bring his invoice from 
$ 4,860 to $ 3,960 a savings of $ 900 

Only this is he wants' a written commitment from LSJ that we will only use him in the future. 

I don't understand why Gary did not do this before the work was done it only took me a little while this 
morning to do this? 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

301 East 66th St 

Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

Cell 

LS) Office 

St. Thomas Office 

NY Office 

Fax (646) 350-0221 

EFTA_R1_00503718 
EFTA02005120



From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2011 11:14 AM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: LSJ Excavator Rental 

negotiate the invoice„ give the guy the story and tell him if we wants work in the future he should 
discount and be competintece 

On Mon, Feb 14, 2011 at 11:10 AM, Emad Hann rote: 

Jeffrey, 

Both companies I was able to get were cheaper 

Company used by Gary is Grade — All charged $ 190 per hour + $ 300 mobilization charge totaling S 
4,860 

I contacted A 9 Trucking and he quoted $ 170 per hour so 3 days would be $ 4,080 (no charge for 
mobilization) 

Cheyenne quoted S 165 per hour and he said he did not need a grapple and the he could move and place 
stones without it this would come out to S 4,360 (includes S 400 mobilization charge) and he said if we 
had a week's worth of work he would drop the rate to $ 150 per hour. He is really slow and needs the work 

VI equipment did not have an excavator for rental. 

Thank you 

Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 
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301 East 66th St 

Suite 101 

New York, NY 10065 

Cell 

IS) Office 

St. Thomas Office 

NY Office 

Fax (646) 350-0221 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mailto:ieevaeation@gmailcomi
Sent: Friday, February 11, 2011 4:06 PM 
To: Emad Hanna 
Subject: Re: LSJ Excavator Rental 

call another vendor„ do not pay it yet. 

On Fri, Feb 11, 2011 at 3:59 PM, Emad Hann wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I contacted the company that Gary rented the excavator from and he gave a rate of $ 1,440 per 
day. Gary got a rate of $ 1,520 per day. 

I contacted another vendor I know that was in this business a year go and he told me he charged $ 
1,280 per day so even though it one year ago. I don't know if Gary got competitive bids or not on 
this. 

How do you want me to handle this invoice of $ 4,860 ? 

Thank you 
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Emad Hanna 

Project Controller 

HBRK Associates 

301 East 66th St 

Suite 10F 

New York, NY 10065 

Cell 

LS3 Office 

St. Thomas Office 

NY Office 

Fax (646) 350-0221 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

***************************EMEE************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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