To: jeevacation@gmail com[jesvacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinfjeevacation@gmail.com]
From:

Sent: Fri 10/26/2012 6:17:02 PM

Subject: Re: Peggy Siegal

great thanks.
On Oct 26, 2012, at 2:15 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

Yes

On Friday, October 26, Zﬂlzﬁ-wmtc:

Peggy Sicgal's office says you agreed to pay for the Ballroom Chairs for the
Gotham Awards...total 1s around $8000. They want me to speak with Mitch
Micich with the event and start coordinating the payment.

Can you confirm you want to pay for the Ballroom Chairs for the Gotham Awards and
would like to start facilitating the payment?
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