
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: Fwd: Re: Fwd: 

mail.com[jeevacabon©gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinbeevacation@gmail.com] 

Sun 3/11/2012 10:06:07 AM 

Jeffrey, Steve came in to see me today... He was pissed and sat down with me to 
emphasize just how P.O.'d. He explained how wrong it was, that it was not right in 
the real world - working world where 1 had just come back in to the company. I 
felt this the whole trip with the girls where nothing seemed right and it did not feel 
like a vacation/meeting of friends. It was more stress and I was actually resentful 
toward & the whole trip, but know the fault is mine. I am upset I 
disappointed you and let you down. Steve was seriously angry and ripped me a 
new one in the middle of the dining room. He had every right to. 

I will be around if you want to talk and have Tues 13/ Wed 14th(?-not 100% 
about Wed) off. Good morning, I'm just now going to sleep. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 9, 2012, at 10:45 AM, jeffrey epstein tevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Sony for all the typos .Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn ‹ > 
Date: March 9, 2012 11:23:50 AM AST 
To: Jeffrey Epstein < ecvacation mail.com> 
Cc: Bella Klein 

Subject: Re: 

i reviewed Sarah's credit card for January and February 
and the total expense for apt 2G was 13,971.29 
this was for all the materials (except tub) in addition to 
furnishings 

i just spoke with anthony barrett and he has been dealing with Penn regarding 
the labor for 2G 

Anthony did not have an exact figure yet but said he has accumulated about 
10,000 in labor costs in addition to the cost of the tub 
which he purchased which cost approximately 1,300. 

The total additional expenses for apt 2G from this email is 25,271.29 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New

York 

NY 10065

On Mar 9, 2012, at 9:36 AM, Bella Klein wrote: 

All of the materials were coded to the inter 
company account NES LLC with 
description 301apt/2G. 
Still looking into Penn... 

On Mar 8, 2012, at 7:26 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

how did bona code this? 

On Thu, Mar 8, 2012 at 8:04 PM, 
wrote: 

I paid for all the materials..tiles, 
toilet, sink, mcd cabinet and 
faucet/shower fixtures. 
Anthony bought the tub. I'm 
not sure about the money to 
Penn; I wasn't dealing with him 

On Mar 8, 2012, at 7:28 PM, Jeffrey Epstein 
leevacation@gmail,com>
wrote: 

the money for 
bathroom 

renovation would 
show up where. 
who paid for it .. ? 
and what about 
money to penn 
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* ****** ********** ****** ************************ 

**** ***** *** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to Lee\ acation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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