
To: jeeyacationtOgmaitcom[jeeyacation@gmail.com]; Jeffrey Epsteinueeyacation@gmail.com] 
From: Roy Hodges 
Sent: Thur 5/23/2013 6:08:27 PM 
Subject: Re: Track hoe 

I met with Peter's guy about the track hoe. He is only wanting to give us about $1000 
as it sits. It would cost us more than that to make it functional enough to get it to the 
barge. Still waiting for the quote from Rimco for repairing it. They have promised us a 
quote by Tuesday. 

Roy 

On Mon, May 20, 2013 at 2:14 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jecvacation:ELliniail.coin> wrote: 

no clue, I would like to know the real numcbr to repair. ? first, 

On Mon, May 20, 2013 at 2:07 PM, Roy Hodges wrote: 

Peter thinks he has someone interested in the trackhoe. What price do you think 
we should ask for it? 

Roy & Stephanie Hodges 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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