
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject Re: Golf cart 

ail.comlJeevacation©gmail.com]; Je vacation[jeevacation@gmail.com] 

Fri 8/31/2012 6:03:23 PM 

They also sell this unit with gas engine, it is very quit, could be an advatage? Same price.. 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> 
Da • 2 14:00:31 -0400 
To: 
Subject: Re: Golf cart 

yes thanks 

On Fri, Aug 31, 2012 at 1:59 PM, wrote 

Should I install extra lights for night ops fwd and aft facing? 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Da • ' 2 13:56:03 -0400 
To 
Subject: Re: Golf cart 

we need a bed in back for laundry 

On Fri, Aug 31, 2012 at 1:42 PMMarote: 

Total price including tax: 
Unit $9,699.00 
Windshield $145.00 
Tax $593.34 
Total $10,482.34 
Unit will be ready thursday next week, same as photo only it will have Tan interior, Black 

exterior, and Tan hard top roof, fold down windshield. 

Is this approved? 

Thank you, 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacationggmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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